
#2024-4 EA COG Joint Purchasing Committee

Street/Road Maintenance Materials

Municipalities 

participating Vendors submitting: opened 4/5/24

check/bid 

bond 

included

Albion

City of Erie Cross Paving yes

Fairview Hei-Way yes

Franklin Lindy Paving yes

Girard Twp McCormick Construction yes

Greene Russell Standard yes

Harborcreek Suit-Kote yes

McKean SealMaster yes

Springfield

Summit

Union City

Waterford

Cross Paving Materials requested Pick up price: RAP Virgin

optional 

delivery 

price to:

City of 

Erie Franklin Girard TwpSpringfield Union City

Hot Mix: 9.5 mm superpave No Bid $82.00 No Bid

9.5 mm superpave w/ Fiber No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 mm Binder Course No Bid $77.00

25 mm Binder course No Bid $72.00

Miafi HP570 (or similar) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cold Patching Material No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

High Performance Patching Material No Bid

4551 W. State St., Hillsville, PA, 16132

Velencia Plant (171 7th Ave, Velencia, PA, 16059)

10965 McHenry Street, Meadville, PA 16335

Pick up locations 

11620 Lake Pleasant Road, Union City, PA 16438

290 N Pike Rd., Sarver, PA 16055

Hot Mix: Pittsburgh Ave, Erie or Sterrettania Rd., Fairview - High Perf. Sterrettania Rd., Fairview

Wesleyville, PA (3340 Pearl Ave, Erie, 16510)



#2024-4 EA COG Joint Purchasing Committee

Street/Road Maintenance Materials

Hei-Way Materials requested Pick up price RAP Virgin

optional 

delivery 

price to:

City of 

Erie Franklin Girard TwpSpringfield Union City

Hot Mix: 9.5 mm superpave No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.5 mm superpave w/ Fiber No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 mm Binder Course No Bid No Bid

25 mm Binder course No Bid No Bid

Miafi HP570 (or similar) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cold Patching Material $98.50

23 Ton 

Min. $119.00 $119.00 $119.00 $119.00

High Performance Patching Material $98.50

Lindy Paving Inc. Materials requested Pick up price RAP Virgin

optional 

delivery 

price to:

City of 

Erie Franklin Girard TwpSpringfield Union City

Hot Mix: 9.5 mm superpave $78.50 $85.50 No Bid

9.5 mm superpave w/ Fiber $87.00 $94.00 No Bid

19 mm Binder Course $70.50 $77.50

25 mm Binder course $68.50 $75.50

Miafi HP570 (or similar) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cold Patching Material $117.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

High Performance Patching Material No Bid



#2024-4 EA COG Joint Purchasing Committee

Street/Road Maintenance Materials

McCormick 

Construction Materials requested Pick up price RAP Virgin

optional 

delivery 

price to:

City of 

Erie Franklin Girard TwpSpringfield Union City

Hot Mix: 9.5 mm superpave $82.00 $87.00 $110.00

9.5 mm superpave w/ Fiber $92.00 $97.00 $125.00

19 mm Binder Course $71.00 $78.00

25 mm Binder course $68.00 $75.00

Miafi HP570 (or similar) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cold Patching Material No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

High Performance Patching Material $140.00

Russell Standard Materials requested Pick up price RAP Virgin

optional 

delivery 

price to:

City of 

Erie Franklin Girard TwpSpringfield Union City

Hot Mix: 9.5 mm superpave No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.5 mm superpave w/ Fiber No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 mm Binder Course No Bid No Bid

25 mm Binder course No Bid No Bid

Miafi HP570 (or similar) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cold Patching Material $115.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00

High Performance Patching Material $115.00



#2024-4 EA COG Joint Purchasing Committee

Street/Road Maintenance Materials

Suit Kote Materials requested Pick up price RAP Virgin

optional 

delivery 

City of 

Erie Franklin Girard TwpSpringfield Union City

Hot Mix: 9.5 mm superpave No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.5 mm superpave w/ Fiber No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 mm Binder Course No Bid No Bid

25 mm Binder course No Bid No Bid

Miafi HP570 (or similar) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cold Patching Material No Bid

High Performance Patching Material $106.00 $107.00 $109.00 $110.00 $122.00

SealMaster Materials requested Pick up price RAP Virgin

optional 

delivery 

price to:

City of 

Erie Franklin Girard TwpSpringfield Union City

Hot Mix: 9.5 mm superpave No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.5 mm superpave w/ Fiber No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 mm Binder Course No Bid No Bid

25 mm Binder course No Bid No Bid

Miafi HP570 (or similar) $1,300/roll No Bid No Bid $0.00

Cold Patching Material No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

High Performance Patching Material No Bid


