
#2024-2 EACOG Joint Bidding 

Asphalt Emulsions

Municipalities participating Opened 4/5/2023 Vendors submitting:

check/bid bond 

included

Albion Township Russell Standard yes

City of Erie Suit-Kote yes

Girard Township SealMaster yes

Summit

Union City

Materials requested Vendor responding Pick up price delivery price to: City of Erie Summit Union City

TACK Russell Standard $2.80 $3.75

Suit-Kote $2.90 $3.50

SealMaster No Bid No Bid

CRS-2 Russell Standard $2.95 $3.35

Suit-Kote $3.20 $3.85

SealMaster No Bid No Bid

Trackless Tack Oil NTT/CNTT Russell Standard No Bid $4.65

Suit-Kote No Bid $3.10

SealMaster No Bid No Bid

Liquid Mastic Asphalt Russell Standard No Bid No Bid

Suit-Kote No Bid No Bid

SealMaster $2646/2700 lbs No Bid

Mercer Plant (1210 Perry Highway, Mercer, PA 16137)

10965 McHenry Street, Meadville, PA 16335

Point of Supply for pickup 

4551 W State St, Hillsville, PA 16132



#2024-2 EACOG Joint Bidding 

Asphalt Emulsions

Modified Asphalt Sealant Blocks

Russell Standard

Option 1 Boxes No Bid No Bid

Boxless No Bid No Bid

Option 2 Boxes No Bid No Bid

Boxless No Bid No Bid

Suite Kote

Option 1 Boxes No Bid No Bid

Boxless No Bid No Bid

Option 2 Boxes No Bid No Bid

Boxless No Bid No Bid

SealMaster

Option 1 Boxes $30.00 $24.00

30lb block with machine Boxless $33.00 $27.00

Option 2 Boxes $23.40

Boxless $26.40


