
#2024 -1 EACOG Joint Bidding

Aggregate and Rock Materials 

Municipalities 

participating opened 4/5/24

Vendors 

submitting:

certified 

check or 

bid bond 

City of Erie

ACA Sand & 

Gravel yes

Edinboro Carmeuse yes

Fairview Erie Aggregates Inc. yes

Franklin Township Nat'l Lime & Stone yes

Girard Township Girts Sand and Gravel yes

Greenfield Township

Harborcreek

Summit Township

Union City

Venango Township

Waterford

765 Bakerink Rd., Clymer, NY, 14724

Point of Supply for pick up

19170 Route 89, Corry, PA, 16407

22 Ore Dock Rd, Erie, 16507

7535 Middleton Rd., Waterford, PA

1681 West 16th St., Erie, PA



#2024 -1 EACOG Joint Bidding

Aggregate and Rock Materials 

Materials requested Vendor responding Pick up price

delivery 

prices to: Fairview Franklin Girard Union City Waterford

Type C # 57 ACA Sand & Gravel $15.60 $27.35 $27.85

Carmeuse No Bid No Bid No Bid

Erie Aggregates Inc. $16.50 $24.00 $24.50

Nat'l Lime & Stone $30.36 $37.36 $37.61

Girts Sand and Gravel $14.75 $27.25 $27.25

AS -1 Anti-skid ACA Sand & Gravel $9.75 $20.50 $21.50 $22.00 $17.25

Carmeuse No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Erie Aggregates Inc. $9.25 $16.75 $16.75 $17.25 $13.25

Nat'l Lime & Stone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Girts Sand and Gravel $6.00 $17.12 $17.12 $17.12 $17.12

AS 3 Anti Skid ACA Sand & Gravel $12.00

Carmeuse No Bid

Erie Aggregates Inc. No Bid

Nat'l Lime & Stone No Bid

Girts Sand and Gravel $11.00

B- 19 ACA Sand & Gravel No Bid

Carmeuse $22.25

Erie Aggregates Inc. No Bid
Will be replaced with 304.02 

non PennDOT Limestone Nat'l Lime & Stone $28.87

Girts Sand and Gravel No Bid



#2024 -1 EACOG Joint Bidding

Aggregate and Rock Materials 

Materials requested Vendor responding Pick up price

delivery 

prices to: Fairview Franklin Girard Union City Waterford

#67 Limestone ACA Sand & Gravel No Bid No Bid

Carmeuse $29.25 $35.75

Erie Aggregates Inc. No Bid No Bid

Nat'l Lime & Stone $30.85 $37.85

Girts Sand and Gravel No Bid No Bid

2 A stone ACA Sand & Gravel $12.50 $24.25 $20.00

Carmeuse No Bid No Bid No Bid

Erie Aggregates Inc. $14.75 $22.25 $20.50

Nat'l Lime & Stone No Bid No Bid No Bid

Girts Sand and Gravel $12.50 $23.12 $22.61

2 A limestone ACA Sand & Gravel No Bid

Carmeuse 22.25$                  

Erie Aggregates Inc. No Bid
Will be replaces with 2AC 

PennDOT approved 2A Nat'l Lime & Stone 28.87$                  

Girts Sand and Gravel No Bid

2B ACA Sand & Gravel 15.60$                  26.35$          

Carmeuse No Bid No Bid

Erie Aggregates Inc. 16.50$                  24.00$          

Nat'l Lime & Stone No Bid No Bid

Girts Sand and Gravel 14.75$                  25.87$          



#2024 -1 EACOG Joint Bidding

Aggregate and Rock Materials 

Materials requested Vendor responding Pick up price

delivery 

prices to: Fairview Franklin Girard Union City Waterford

MH 2A (4-11) ACA Sand & Gravel No Bid No Bid No Bid

Carmeuse $22.25 $29.50 $31.25

Erie Aggregates Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

Will be replaced with 2AF 

411 Limeston, non PennDOT Nat'l Lime & Stone $28.87 $34.12 No Bid

Girts Sand and Gravel No Bid No Bid No Bid

2RC bank gravel ACA Sand & Gravel $11.00 $21.75 $22.75 $23.25 $15.50

Carmeuse No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Erie Aggregates Inc. $12.25 $19.75 $19.75 $20.25 $15.75

Nat'l Lime & Stone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Girts Sand and Gravel $10.75 $21.87 No Bid $22.87 $16.55

Driving Surface Aggregate ACA Sand & Gravel No Bid No Bid

#411 (2A) Carmeuse $22.25 $29.25

Erie Aggregates Inc. No Bid

Nat'l Lime & Stone No Bid No bid

Girts Sand and Gravel No Bid No bid

R-4 ACA Sand & Gravel No Bid No Bid No bid

Carmeuse No Bid No Bid No Bid

Erie Aggregates Inc. No Bid No Bid No bid

Nat'l Lime & Stone $39.29 $44.54 $46.29

Girts Sand and Gravel No Bid No Bid No Bid



#2024 -1 EACOG Joint Bidding

Aggregate and Rock Materials 

Materials requested Vendor responding Pick up price

delivery 

prices to: Fairview Franklin Girard Union City Waterford

# 57 Stone/Oversized RockACA Sand & Gravel No Bid No Bid

Carmeuse No Bid No Bid

Erie Aggregates Inc. $15.50 $23.50

Nat'l Lime & Stone No Bid No Bid

Girts Sand and Gravel $13.00 $24.12



#2024 -1 EACOG Joint Bidding

Aggregate and Rock Materials 


