

Municipalities participating	Bidders responding:	Bid Bond/ Certified Check received:	Notes:
City of Erie	Chemung Supply	yes	none
Edinboro	US Municipal Supply	yes	Must be ordered in bundles of 50 U- Channel
Millcreek			25 for Galvanized. 30 days for delivery
Product:	Bidders:	Chemung Supply	US Municipal Supply
U Channel Bar Post	Length & lbs/ft	Prices:	
<b>Standard</b>	3 & 2.5	\$4.85	no bid
	3.5 & 2.5	\$5.50	\$6.39
	4 & 3	\$7.55	no bid
	8 & 2.5	\$11.95	\$14.60
	9 & 2.5	\$13.35	\$16.44
	10 & 2.5	\$15.45	\$18.26
	12 & 2.5	\$18.65	\$21.91
<b>Galvanized</b>	3 & 2.5	\$6.15	no bid
	3.5 & 2.5	\$6.95	\$8.52
	4 & 3	\$9.35	no bid
	8 & 2.5	\$15.35	\$19.47
	9 & 2.5	\$17.25	\$21.91
	10 & 2.5	\$19.15	\$24.34
	12 & 2.5	\$22.50	\$29.21
Galvanized Square posts	Lgth/size/gauge	Chemung Supply	US Municipal Supply
Square Base	2.5x2.25x12	\$7.25	\$7.49
	3x2.25x12	\$8.55	\$9.25
	3.5x2.25x12	\$10.25	no bid
	4x2.25x12	\$11.70	no bid
	8x2x14	\$15.65	\$16.50
	9x2x14	\$18.35	\$18.00
	10x2x14	\$19.50	\$20.00
Ground penetrator	2.5x2.25x12	\$8.60	\$11.85
	3x2.25x12	\$9.30	\$13.73
	3.5x2.25x12	\$10.90	no bid
	4x2.25x12	\$12.50	no bid

Breakaway Bolt Assemblies		Chemung Supply	US Municipal Supply
U-Channel	Standard	\$9.25	no bid
	Lap Splice	\$7.15	\$4.85
	Other	\$4.95	no bid
Bolts & Nuts	U-Channel	\$1.25	no bid
	Square Tube	\$0.85	\$0.45
Splices	U-Channel	\$12.75	no bid