

Municipalities participating	Vendors responding	Vendor Notes:	check/bid bond included (\$500)
Edinboro	Waterford Precast & Sales, Inc	2'x 3'x42" basins available	Yes
Harborcreek		no minimum order	
Greenfield	Seneca Mineral:	knock out walls will be 2"	Yes
Millcreek		concrete not 3" concrete	
Summit	Boxes will be precast to customer size opening specs, not drilled as per bid spec:		
Products:	Waterford Precast Pricing:	Seneca Mineral Pricing:	
Basin w/ frame & bike grate			
2' X 2' X 2'	\$477.00	\$492.80	
2' X 3' X 3'	\$627.00	no bid	
2' X 2' X 3'	\$522.00	\$532.00	
2' X 3' X 4'		no bid	
2' X 4' X 3'	\$742.00	\$780.00	
basin w/ frame & standard steel grate			
2' X 3' X 3'	\$740.00	no bid	
2' X 2' X 3'	\$585.00	\$532.00	
Basin \$/ Frame& bike grate\$	Basin	Frame & Grate	Basin Frame & Grate
2' X 2' X 2'	\$205.00	\$272.00	\$242.80 \$250.00
2' X 3' X 3'	\$295.00	\$332.00	no bid
2' X 2' X 3'	\$250.00	\$272.00	\$282.00 \$250.00
2' X 3' X 4'	No bid		no bid
2' X 4' X 3'	\$348.00	\$ 394.00	\$380.00 \$400.00
Basin \$/ Frame & standard steel	Basin	Frame & Grate	Basin Frame & Grate
2' X 4' X 3'	\$348.00	\$540.00	\$380.00 \$400.00
2'X 2' X 3'	\$250.00	\$335.00	\$282.00 \$750.00
Risers			
2' X 3' X 3"	\$80.00	no bid	
2' X 3' X 6"	\$90.00	no bid	
2' X 3' X 12"	\$100.00	no bid	
2' X 2' X 6"	\$80.00		\$110.00
2' X 2' X 12"	\$90.00		\$120.00

S