ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS
JOINT BIDDING COMMITTEE
2021

BiD#2021-8
BREAKAWAY SIGN POSTS & ASSEMBLIES

PLEASE CONTACT JESSICA HORAN-KUNCO WITH QUESTIONS
AT JHKUNCO@ERIEAREACOG.ORG
OR (814) 454-1770

PROPOSAL FROM:

COMPANY: Vulcan Inc.,dba Vulcan Signs

ADDRESS: PO BOX 1850

Foley, AL 36536

CONTACT NAME: pavid B. Beviacqua
PHONE #: 800-633-6845

E-MAl[_: vulcan3@vulcaninc.com

DATE: 4/22/2021




ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS

150 East Front Street - Suite 300 - Erie, PA 16507
Phone (814) 454-1770 - Email jhkunco@erieareacog.org

TO: ALL PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS

FROM: EACOG'S JOINT MUNICIPAL BIDDING COMMITTEE
SUBJECT:  SOLICITATION OF BIDS - Breakaway Sign Posts & Assemblies
DATE: April 19, 2021

Sealed proposals will be received by the Erie Area Council of Governments Joint Bidding Committee, acting
on behalf of the municipalities of the City of Erie, the County of Erie, the Boroughs of Albion, Edinboro,
Girard, Union City, and Wesleyville, the Townships of Fairview, Franklin, Girard, Greenfield, Greene,
Harborcreek, Lawrence Park, LeBoeuf, Millcreek, North East, Summit, Union and Venango. Proposals
must be enclosed in a sealed envelope addressed to the Erie Area Council of Governments Joint Municipal
Bidding Committee and should bear the name and address of the bidder and the item or items which are bid
on the exterior of the sealed envelope.

Sealed bids may be dropped off, delivered or mailed until 10:00 am on Tuesday, May 4, 2021 to:
Erie Area Council of Governments

150 East Front St. Ste 300

Erie, PA 16507

No bids will be accepted via e-mail or website.

All sealed bids submitted shall be opened and read aloud on

May 4, 2021 at 1:00 pm at the

Harborcreek Township Building

5601 Buffalo Rd. Harborcreek, PA 16421

Due to Covidl9, the public is encouraged to view the bid opening via Live Stream on
facebook.com/ErieAreaCOG/

Items for which bids will be received include:

Breakaway Sign Posts & Assemblies
The role of the EACOG'S Joint Bidding Committee is to combine the participant’s anticipated annual material
requirement, to agree on a standard bidding specifications acceptable to all participating municipalitics and to
seek competitive bids for all items jointly, in an effort to receive a lower, more equitable price for all

participating local governments. Each municipality reserves the right to reject any and all bids.

If you have any question regarding the following bidding specification/procedures, please contact Jessica
Horan-Kunco, Executive Director at 814-454-1770 or jhkunco@ericareacog.org.



ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS
JOINT MUNICIPAL BIDDING COMMITTEE

INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

ARTICLE I - DEFINITIONS

Wherever used in these contract documents or specifications, the following
terms shall have the meanings indicated and shall be applicable to both
the singular and plural thereof:

Bidder - Any person, firm, or corporation submitting a bid.

Contract - The signed written agreement between the Owner and the
Contractor covering the materials, supplies, equipment, product and/or
services to be purchased.

Contract Date - The effective date of the beginning of the Contract time.
Such date to be in accord with Article IX and to be indicated by the Owner
in the notice of award.

Contract Documents - The contract documents shall consist of the
advertisement Zfor bids or notice to bidders; bid security; performance
bonds; instructions to bidders; form of proposal; the Contract, the

general and specizal conditions of contract; and the detaill specifications,
including all modifications thereof incorporated in any of the documents
befcre the execution ¢f the Contract.

Contract Term - The calendar period stated in the Contract and/or Form of
Proposal for the completion of the project and/or Contract as specified.

Contractor - The person, firm, or corporation with whom the Owner has
executed the Contract.

Form of Proposal - The offer or proposal of the bidder submitted on the
prescribed form setting forth the prices for the material and/or services
to be furnished.

Modification - Any written amendment of any of the contract documents
(including change orders) duly executed and delivered after executions of
the Contract.

Notice - Written notice shall be deemed to have been duly served if
delivered in person or electronically wvia email or website download to
the individual c¢r to a member of the firm or to an officer of the
corporation for whom it is intended, or to an authorized representative
cf such individual, firm cr corporation.



Number - The singular shall be deemed to include the plural, and the
plural the singular, as the context may require and is the masculine
gender.

Owner - During bidding procedures, the Owner shall be represented by the
Erie Area Council of Governments Joint Municipal Bidding Committee. During
the Bidder selection and contract terms selection, and after the
finalization of the Contract with the individual Participants, the Owner
shall generally be understood to be the Participants named in the contract
document and/or each Contract,

Participants - Those current member municipalities of the Erie Area
Council of Governments and other specified Municipalities, Municipal
Authorities, and School districts who hereby desire to participate in the
Erie Area Council of Governments Joint Municipal Bidding Program. These
municipalities shall include the County of Erie, City of Erie; Boroughs
of Albion, Edinboro, Girard, Union City and Wesleyville; the Townships of
Fairview, Franklin, Girard, Greene, Greenfield, Harborcreek, Lawrence
Park, LeBoeuf, Millcreek, North East, Summit, Union and Venango.

Security - Bid bond, performance bond, payment bond, certified check, and
other instruments of security, furnished by the bidder and his surety in
accordance with the contract documents.

ARTICLE II - AWARD, EXECUTION OF DOCUMENTS, DELIVERY OF BONDS

The award of the Contract, if it is awarded, will be +t¢ the lowest
responsible Bidder whose qualifications indicate the award will be in the
best interest of the Owner and whose proposal complies with all the
prescribed requirements, No award will be made until the Owner has
concluded such investigaticns as deemed necessary to establish the
responsibility, qualifications and financial ability of the Bidder to
complete the project or to provide the regquested material, supplies,
equipment, product and/or services tec the satisfaction of the OQwner,
within the time prescribed. The Owner reserves the right to reject the
bid of any Bidder who doces not pass such investigation to the Owner's
satisfaction.

The Owner reserves the right to reject any or all bids, in whole or part,
and to waive any informality in bids received when such is in the best
interest of the Owner and to reject the bid(s) of a Bidder who in the
opinion of the Owner is not in a position to perform the Contract. FEach
municipality reserves the right to reject any bid, without jeopardizing
the bid price to those municipalities who desire to award or accept the
bid.




In analyzing bids, the Owner may take into consideration alternates and
unit prices if requested by the Form of Propcsal. The Owner will give
the successful Bidder written notice of the award within sixty (60) day
after the opening of the bids. The Owner shall be required to take the
proper action to accept or reject the bids submitted with sixty (60) days
of the bid copening.

Each municipality will execute its own Contract or purchase crder with
the successful Bidders and shall be liable only for supplies, equipment,
material, product and/or services contracted for by itself. Each
successful Bidder shall be required to invoice each participating
municipality separately.

Upon notification and within ten (10) days of the execution of the contract
documents and at the discretion of the municipality the vendor may be
required to deliver a performance bond as security for the faithful
performance of this Contract. The performance bond will be provided
payable to the municipality. The performance bond shall be in the amount
of fifty percent (50%) of the Contract amount based on the estimated
gquantities of the awarding municipality detailed elsewhere and the
bidder's proposed price.

Failure of the successful Bidder to execute the contract deocuments and
deliver any required security within ten days {10) of the notification of
the award shall be just cause for the Owner to annul the award and declare
the bid and any guarantee therecf forfeited.

The bid security of all Bidders except that of the two {2) apparent lowest
Bidders will be returned within one (1) month of the bid opening. The
bid security of the two (2) apparent lowest bidders will be returned upon
finalization of the agreement with the successful Bidder.

ARTICLE III - REQUIREMENTS FOR SIGNING BIDS

Each bid must give the full business name and address of the Bidder and
be signed by him with his usual signature. All bids must ke signed. Bids
which are not signed by the individual making them, should have attached
thereto a power-of-attorney evidencing authority to sign the bid in the
name of the person for whom it is signed. Bids by partnership must furnish
the full name of all partners and must be signed in the partnership name
by all of the partners or by an attorney-in-fact.

If signed by an attorney-in-fact, there should be attached to the bid a
power-of-attorney evidencing authority to sign the bid{s) executed by the
partners. Bids by corporations must be signed with the legal name of the
corpocration, followed by the name of the state of incorporation and by
the signature of the president or vice-president, or other officer of the
corporation authorized to bind it in these matters; together with zthe
impression of the corporate seal, attested by the secretary of the
corporation. When reguested by the Owner, satisfactory evidence of the
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autheority of the officer signing in behalf of the corporation shall be
furnished.

ARTICLE IV - CERTIFIED STATEMENTS

Bidders may be required to submit sworn statements of their financial
responsibility, technical qualifications, previous experience,
performance record or other pertinent data designed te indicate the
Bidder's capabkility to execute this Contract competently and successfully.

ARTICLE V - CHANGES WHILE BIDDING

During the bidding period, Bidders may be furnished with addenda for
additions or alteration to the bidding specifications. These shall be
included in the bid proposal and shall become a part of the contract
documents. The Bidder shall be required to indicate the receipt of such
addenda.

ARTICLE VI - WITHDRAWAL CF BIDS

Any Bidder may withdraw his bid at any time prior to the scheduled time
for the receipt of bids. No bid may be withdrawn after the time and date
set forth in the Notice to Bidders, which -indicates when bids shall be
opened. Negligence con the part of the Bidder in preparing the bid confers
no right for the withdrawal of the bid after it has been opened.

ARTICLE VII - CONTRACT MODIFICATION

After the contract date, the EACOG member and joint bidding participants
reserve the right to enter into a Contract with a successful Bidder--
utilizing the initial cor established bidding terms, conditions and prices-
—-for any supplies, product, material, eguipment and/or services that were
included in the successful Bidders' initial joint bid proposal. This
procedure will permit a participating municipality to fulfill its
municipal code's ©purchasing regulations and furthermore allow a
participating municipality to enter into a Contract with a successful
Bidder, even though that municipality was not included in the initial bid
request. This provision is not extended to municipalities that are neither
EACOG members nor Joint Bidding participants, a list of eligible
participants is included in the Special Conditions section.

If for any reason, the initial bidding specifications include or fail to
include a minor and/or ¢losely related requirement--thaft is desirable of
the Owner to change, add to or delete from the awarded Contract--the Owner
shall have the right, through the issuance of a change order and granting
approval of the Contracter, to change, add to or delete from the Contract,
such minor or closely related requirements. {(Examples of changes,
additions or deletions c¢f minor or closely related requirements shall
include, but are not limited to--colors, sizes or accessory eguipment).
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ARTICLE VIII - VERBAL STATEMENTS

No verbal or oral interpretation of plans or specifications will be given
before the award of the Contract. Dis¢repancies, omissions, or doubts as
to the meaning of plans or specifications should be communicated to the
Owner in writing for clarification. Any interpretation made will be in
the form of an addendum to the specifications which will be forwarded to
all BRidders. See Article V. '

ARTICLE IX - CONTRACT DURATION

Unless otherwise noted or specified, all Contracts shall commence with
the Contract Date and expire on May 30, 2022 or on May 30t of subsequent
vears if extended by mutual agreement. Those municipalities having
Contracts for supplies, equipment, material, product and/or services whose
term extends intc the period covered by this Contract time will have the
right to participate in a Contract with the successful Bidder as their
individual obligations expire.

ARTICLE X - BIDS OR PROPOSALS

211 bids must be indicated upon the Form of Proposal attached hereto.
Bidders shall submit the completed bid documents either by mail drop off
or delivery. All proposals must be addressed as outlined in this document.
The Bidders may bid on any or all items called for in the Form of Proposal;
if an item or alternate is called for on a type of equipment or material
or method on which the Bidder does not desire to bid, he may insert the
words "No Bid" in the space provided for prices on such item(s) or
alternate(s). If it is determined by the Owner toc use alternate type of
equipment, type of material, or method--the fact that the cost of an
alternative type of equipment, material or method bid by a Bidder may be
lower than that chosen, shall not constitute the basis or a claim by the
Bidder that the Ccntract shall be awarded to him. In the case that =
Bidder desires to bid on an alternate, he shall set forth in the space
provided in the Form of Proposal the explanation and amount to be added
or deducted from the base bid. If an alternate price called for does not
involve a change in price, the Bidder shall so indicate by inserting the
words "No Change" in the space provided. If any type of discount is offered
by the Bidder for prompt payment of bills or other consideration, such
may also be set forth on the Form of Proposal.

Erasures or changes in a bid must be explained or noted over the signature
of the Bidder. Bids containing any conditions, omissicons, unexplained
erasures or alterations or items not called for in the proposal or
irreqularities of any kind, may be rejected by the Owner as being
incomplete.




Bids shall be accompanied by bid security as provided in the Special
Conditions section.

ARTICLE XI - DEVIATIONS/ ALTERNATE PROPOSALS

Bidders desiring to submit proposals on materials, supplies, product,
equipment and/or services in substantial conformance to these
specifications but not meeting some details of the specifications exactly,
shall list the specific deviations in the space provided in the Form of
Proposal. Bidders should be aware that such a bid will be thoroughly
evaluated but that it also will be considered as an alternate bid within
the meaning of Article X and, therefore, the Owner does not obligate
itself to award the Contract to such a Bidder although this bid price may
be lower than the lowest bid in conformance with these Specifications.
The Cwner reserves the right to decide which bid most nearly meets the
intent of these Specifications.

ARTICLE XII - BIDDERS'S RESPONSIBILITY

Each Bidder is required to familiarize himself with all of the attached
forms, including but not necessarily limited to Notice to Bidders,
Instructions to Bidders, Special Conditions, Detail Specifications, and
form of proposal. Each Bidder will be held responsibkle to fully comply
therewith., Each Bidder must acquaint himself thoroughly with the
conditions under which materials, supplies, equipment, product and/or
services shall be utilized.

ARTICLE XTTI — QUANTITIES

The estimated guantities given in the Special Conditions are for bidding
purposes only. The estimated quantities are based on each municipality's
estimated volume for the period. The Owner does not guarantee any given
quantity. The municipalities may purchase more or less than the estimated
amounts, and the vendor may not assume that these estimates are a part of
the Contract. The vendor shall be required to supply the participating
municipalities on an as-needed basis, throughout the Contract duration.

ARTICLE XIV - TAXES

All bid prices are to be less Federal, State or local taxes except as
required by law.



JOINT BIDDING SPECIFICATION

BREAKAWAY STEEL SIGN PCSTS
AND ASSEMBLIES

ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS

JOINT BIDDING COMMITTEE

April 192, 2021

Administered by:

Erie Area Council of Governments
150 East Front St. Suite 300
Erie, PA 16507

814-454-1770
jhkunceo@erieareacog.org




ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS
JOINT BIDDING COMMITTEE
SPECIAL CONDITIONS
2021

BREAKAWAY STEEL POSTS AND BREAKAWAY BOLT ASSEMBLIES

Bids are requested, as specified, for the Townships of Lawrence Park and
Franklin and the Borough of Union City with the same bid price for each
size of Steel U Channel Bar Posts, Bolt Assembly and Square Tube Posts
available to the following Erie Area Council of Governments members and
Joint Bidding participants: the County of Erie, City of Erie, Boroughs of
Blbion, Edinboro, Girard, Wesleyville, Townships of Fairview, Girard,
Greene, Greenfield, Harborcreek, LeBoeuf, Millcreek, North East, Summit,
Union, Venango.

Approximate expected Bid Quantities are as follows as with the expectation
that other participating municipalities will request additional products.

Breakaway Steel Posts

U-Channel Bar Posts Sguare Posts
Length Pounds Per Approximate Size
Approximate
In Feet Foct (Lb/Ft) Quantities (Inches) Gauge  Quantities
2 1/2 - 2 1/4 12 35
3 * 2 1/2 2 1/4 12 20
3 1/2 * 2 1/2 - 2 1/4 12 15
4 * 3 2 1/4 12
8 2 1/2 45 2 14
9 2 1/2 15 2 14 -
10 2 1/2 - 2 14 15
12 2 1/2 - 2 14 -

* With a Tapered or Pointed End for U-Channel Posts

Breakaway Bolt Assemblies: as needed

Standard, Lap Splice,
or other combinations

Square Belts and Nuts

General Redquirements:

Successful bidder shall be required to make delivery pick up of subject
Posts and Bolt Assemblies to the participating municipalities.
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ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS
JOINT BIDDING COMMITTEE

DETAILED SPECIFICATIONS
2021
BREAKAWAY STEEL POSTS AND BREAKAWAY BOLT ASSEMBLIES
Please provide as comprehensive a price list as possible:

Bid Security is not required.

STEEL CHANNEL BAR POSTS AND BREAKAWAY BOLT ASSEMBLIES

All Steel Channel Bar Posts and Breakaway Bolt Assemblies to be furnished
shall conform to the current material specifications of the Pennsylvania
Department of Transportation - Specification 408-Section 1103.08. Vendors
must be on the Pennsylvania Department of Transportation Bulletin 15
Approved List.

U-Channel Pcsts

All posts furnished must have three/eights inch (3/8") holes on one inch
(1"™) centers.

Short posts must be furnished with pointed or tapered ends.

All post furnished shall be green.

Square Tube Posts

All posts furnished must have holes seven/sixteenth inch (7/16") [+/-
1/64"] in diameter on one inch (1") centers on all four sides down the
entire length. Holes shall be on centerline of each side in true alignment
and opposite each other directly and diagonally.

All posts furnished shall have interiors and exteriors galvanized.

Information Required

All bids for Breakaway Steel Posts are to reflect price of standard paint
finish for color green. All bids should alsc reflect, as an option, when
available, the price of galvanized paint finish for the color green.

All bidders shall submit Detailed Descriptions and Specifications on
Breakaway Steel Posts, Breakaway Bolt Assemblies, Warranties, Packaging
Configurations, Installation and Maintenance Directions.
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ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS
JOINT BIDDING COMMITTEE

FORM OF PROPOSAL
2021
BREAKAWAY STEEL POSTS AND BREAKAWAY BOLT ASSEMBLIES

I/We have investigated the availability of the equipment specified and
agree to furnish and deliver all the specified equipment at the folleowing
prices:

BASE BID Price of Each picked up

Breakaway Steel Posts

U-Channel Bar Posts

Length Pounds Per Paint Finish
In Feet Foot {1 Lb/Ft) Standard Galvanized
3 2 1/2 $ 7.89 $ 9.60
3 1/2 2 1/2 $ g.21 $ 11.20
4 3 $12.60 $ 15,40
8 2 1/2 §21.04 $ 25.60
9 2 1/2 5 23.67 $ 28.80
10 2 1/2 $ 26.30 $ 32.00
12 2 1/2 S 31.56 $ 38.40

Galvanized Square Posts

Length Size Ground
In Feet {Inches) Gauge Sguare Base Penetrator
2 1/2 2 1/4 12 $ 15.79 $ NO BID

3 2 1/4 12 $ 18.94 ¢ NO BID

3 1/2 2 1/4 12 § 22.10 ¢ NO BID

4 2 1/4 12 $ 25.26 § NO BID

8 2 14 $ 34.29

9 2 14 $ 38.57

10 2 14 S 42,86

Breakaway Bolt Assemblies U-Channel

Standard $ NO BID Each Other $ ©NO BID Each

Lap Splice g 6.95 Each
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ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENITS
JOINT BIDDING COMMITTEE

FORM QOF PROPCSAL
2021
BREAKAWAY STEEL POSTS AND BREAKAWAY BOLT ASSEMBLIES Con't

Bolts and Nuts

U-Channel $ NO BID Each

Square Tube s 60 Each
Splices

U-Channel $ NO BID Each

Bid Prices sheould reflect the Total Volume of all participants seeking
bids.

Delivery Requirements: specify minimum quantities, related delivery

requirements and charges:

All Uchannel Posts must be bought in bundles of 50 F\)
e

All square posts must be bought in bundles of 25

If needing FLATBED delivery it will be at an extra cost.

Must be bought in 10001lbs and over or an extra delivery charge will be added
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ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS
JOINT BIDDING COMMITTEE

FORM OF PROPOSAL
2021

Alternative Proposal:

Bidders desiring to furnish and deliver the specified equipment in
substantial compliance with these specifications but differing slightly
in some respects shall be required to indicate in the spaces provided
below IN DETAIL the specific deviations of the unit they propose to
furnish. A propesal containing no entries in these spaces below will be
assumed by the Municipalities as being in complete compliance with these
specifications.
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ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS
JOINT BIDDING COMMITTEE

FORM OF PROPOSAL

2021

BREARKAWAY STEEL POSTS AND BREAKAWAY BOLT ASSEMBLIES

Accompanying this Proposal is a certified check/bid bond (circle one) in
the amount of not required dollars made payable to the Erie Area
Council of Governments, Erie, Pennsylvania, which 1s agreed, shall be
retained as liquidated damages by the Erie Area Council of Governments if
the undersigned fails to execute a Contract in conformity with the Contract
Documents and furnish any specified bonds within ten (10) days after
notification of award of the Contract to the undersigned. It is agreed
that this Proposal may not be withdrawn for a period of sixty (60) days
from the opening therecf.

I/We hereby certify that I/we have read, understand, and agree to all the
conditions outlined in the Notice to Bidders, Instructions to Bidders,
Special Conditions, Detail Specifications, and all other parts of the
Contract Documents. I am/We are the only person(s) interested in the
Proposal as principal(s). This Proposal is made without collusion with
any person, firm or corporation.

Company Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs

Address PO BOX 1850

Foley, AL 36536

Phone 800~-633-6845

ATTEST:

F-Mail Vvulcan3@vulcaninc.com

Notary At-farge Signed M

(Title)
Name David B. Beviacqu

My Commission Expires 2/25/2023 (Type or Print)

Title Vice President & General Manager

{SEAL) Date 4/22/2021
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