ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS JOINT BIDDING COMMITTEE 2019

BID # 2019 – 2 AGGREGATE AND ROCK MATERIALS

PLEASE CONTACT JESSICA HORAN-KUNCO WITH QUESTIONS

AT JHKUNCO@ERIEAREACOG.ORG

OR (814) 454-1770

PROPOSAL FROM:

COMPANY: ACA SAND AND CRAYER LLC

ADDRESS: 8955 WATTSBURG RD

ERIE, PA 10509

CONTACT NAME: DONALD MAY

PHONE #: 814-665-6687

E-MAIL: don. acagrave la gmail. com

DATE: 4 - 8 - 19

ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS JOINT MUNICIPAL BIDDING COMMITTEE FORM OF PROPOSAL 2019

AGGREGATE, STONE and ROCK MATERIALS

I/We have investigated the availability of the specified materials and agree to furnish F.O.B. all the specified materials at the following prices:

UNIT PRICE PER TON
PICKED-UP AND LOADED
ON MUNICIPAL TRUCKS

Type C-Crushed Washed Aggregate AASHTO No. 57 AS -1 Anti-Skid Material	\$ 9.00 \$ 600
B 19	\$ NO BID
# 67 Limestone	\$ No Bid
2 A stone	\$ 7.50
#8 stone(glacial stone)	\$ 9.00
MH 2A (411)	\$ NO BID
2 RC bank gravel	\$ 6.25
Natural # 3 stone	\$ 9.00

*Bidders Point of Supply Complit #5 -ACA Sand + Cravel LLC
19170 AA-89, CORRY, AA 16407

Optional Delivered Price per ton to:				
	Franklin	Girard	Greenfield	Harborcreek
Location of municipal site:	Township	Township	Township	Township
	10411 Rt.98	10140 Ridge Rd	11184 Rich	5601 BuffaloRd.
	16412	16417	Hill Rd.16428	16421
Materials			10.1.0	
Type C-Crushed Washed #57		\$ 17.00	\$ 14.25 \$ 11.25	irno
AS 1 Anti-skid	\$ <u>14.60</u>	\$ 15.00	\$ <u>11.25</u>	\$ 15.00
<u>B 19</u>	SNO BIO	\$ NO BID		
#67 Limestone	\$ NO BIO	\$ NO BID		
2 A stone			\$ <u>12.75</u>	
#8 stone (glacial)		+ 3/2 / 0 / 43	\$ <u>14.00</u>	
MH 2A (411)		\$/VO BID		
2 RC bank gravel		\$ 15.25	* 100 2.0	
Natural # 3 stone			\$ <u>15.25</u>	i
Location of site:	Edinboro	Lawrence Park	Millcreek	LeBoeuf
	eadville St.	4230 Iroquois	3608 West 26th	14270 Flatts
Materials	16412	16511	16506	Rd. 16441
Type C-Crushed Washed #57		10311	\$ 15,00	110. 10441
AS 1 Anti-skid	\$ <u>14.み5</u> \$ 11.み5		+	
B 19	T_11 7 . 3	\$NO BID		
#67 Limestone		T		
2 A Stone		\$ 14.50		
#8 stone (glacial)		1		
MH 2A (411)	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BIO		\$ NO BIO
2 RC bank gravel	\$ 11.50	\$ 13.25		
Natural # 3 stone			1	

ERIE AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS' JOINT MUNICIPAL BIDDING COMMITTEE

FORM OF PROPOSAL 2019

AGGREGATE, STONE and ROCK MATERIALS

Accompanying this Proposal is a certified check of bid bond
(circle one) in the amount of $\frac{5^{\circ}/o}{}$ dollars(\$)
made payable to the Erie Area Council of Governments, Erie,
Pennsylvania, which is agreed, shall be retained as liquidated
damages by the Erie Area Council of Governments if the
undersigned fails to execute a Contract in conformity with the
Contract Documents and furnish any specified bonds
within ten (10) days after notification of award of the
Contract to the undersigned. It is agreed that this Proposal
may not be withdrawn for a period of sixty (60) days from the
opening thereof.

I/We hereby certify that I/we have read, understand, and agree to all the conditions outlined in the Solicitation of Bids, Instructions to Bidders, Special Conditions, Detail Specifications, and all other parts of the Document. I am/We are the only person(s) interested in the Proposal as principal(s). This Proposal is made without collusion with any person, firm or corporation.

2 1 ,		
	Company	ACA Sand and Gravel LLC
	Address	8955 WATTSburg RO
		ERIE, PA 16509
	Phone	814-645-6087
ATTEST:	Email	don.acagravel@gmail.com
Lebesca M. / homson	Signed	Devorat & win
Business Manager	Name	DEBORAH A WILL
/ (Title) O		(Type or Print)
	Title	Member
	Date	4-8-19
(SEAL)		,

ERIE INSURANCE COMPANY BID BOND

Know All Men by These Presents,	Bond No. AA1553-04052019-2		
That we, ACA SAND & GRAVEL (hereinafter called the Principal) as Principal and the ERIE INSURANCE COMPANY, of Erie, Pennsylvania, a corporation duly organized under the laws of the State of Pennsylvania, (hereinafter called the Surety),			
as Surety, are held and firmly bound unto ERIE AREA COUNTY	NCIL OF GOVERNMENTS		
hereinafter called the Obligee in the	ne full and just sum of 5% OF BID		
Signed, sealed and dated this 5TH	day of APRIL , A.D. 2019		
THE CONDITION OF THIS OBLIGATION IS SUCH: The	at, if the Obligee shall make any award within 60		
days to the Principal for AGGREGATE AND ROCK MATER	IĄĻŞ		
according to the terms of the proposal or bid made by the Principal therefor, and the Principal shall dully make and enter into a contract with the Obligee in accordance with the terms of said proposal or bid and award and shall give bond for the faithful performance thereof with the Surety or Sureties approved by the Obligee; or if the Principal shall, in case of failure so to do, pay the Obligee the damages which the Obligee may suffer by reason of such failure, not exceeding the penalty of this bond, then this obligation shall be null and void; otherwise it shall be and remain in full force and effect.			
In Testimony Whereof, the Principal and Surety have caused these presents to be duly signed and sealed.			
	ACA Sand & Gravel Principal		
Docusigned by: Joan Carneral Witness:	By: Duboral Will 41F9C48D06EF447		
Docusigned by: Joan Carneval Witness: 410086860808468	ERIE INSURANCE COMPANY Bocusigned by: Was Change 5247143AFEF7456Attorney-in-Fact		



LIMITED POWER OF ATTORNEY

I ISUI ALIUG	
KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS: That ERIE IN laws of the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, does hereby it	ISURANCE COMPANY, a corporation duly organized under the make, constitute and appoint
	e W. Weed, Joan M. Carneval and Mark C. Kramer
deed: any and all bonds and undertakings of sureryship.	execute, seal and deliver for and on its behalf, and as its act and live hundred thousand dollars (\$500,000,00).
	•
ings and other writings obligatory in the nature thereof	s fully and to the same extent as if such bonds and undertak- were signed by the appropriate officer of ERIE INSURANCE icers, and hereby ratifies and confirms all that its said Attorney(s)-
The Power of Attorney is granted under and by authority of ERIE INSURANCE COMPANY on the 2nd day of Septemb	f the following Resolutions adopted by the Board of Directors of er, 2016, and said Resolutions have not been amended or repealed:
Appoint Attorney(s)-in-Fact and to authorize them to execute	/ice President or Vice President shall have power and authority to: (a) on behalf of the Company, bonds and undertakings, recognizances, ture thereof, and, (b) Remove any such Attorney-in-Pact at any time
issued to them, to execute and deliver on behalf of the Comp	thority, subject to the torms and limitations of the Power of Attorney any, bonds and undertakings, recognizances, contracts of indemnity rate seal is not necessary for the validity of any bonds and undertakes obligatory in the nature thereof."
This Limited Power of Attorney is signed and sealed by factor by the Board of Directors of ERIE INSURANCE COMPA not been amended or repealed:	similes under and by virtue of the following Resolution adopted NY on the 2nd day of September, 2016, and said Resolution has
may be affixed by the following facsimiles on any Limited Pozances, contracts and other writings in the nature thereof, and Scal of the Company, the signature of Sheila M. Hirsch, as Not	hief Executive Officer of the Company, and the Seal of the Company ower of Attorney for the execution of bonds, undertakings, recognited signature of Brian W. Bolash, as Secretary of the Company, the ary Public, and her notarial seal, may also be affixed by the following limited Power of Attorney, and only under such circumstances shall
	SPACE CANCE
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, ERIE INSURANCE COMPANY has caused these presents to be signed by its Chief Executive Officer, and its corporate seal to be hereto affixed this 18th day of October, 2016.	1972 In one Officer
COMMONWEALTH OF PENNSYLVANIA SS. COUNTY OF ERIE	Timothy G. NeCastro Chief Executive Officer
On this 18th day of October, 2016, before me personally came Timothy G. NeCastro, to me known, who being by me duly sworn, did depose and say: that he is Chief Executive Officer of ERIE INSURANCE COMPANY, the corporation described in and which executed the above instrument; that he knows the Seal of said corporation; that the Seal affixed to the said instrument is such corporate Seal; that it was so affixed by order of the Board of Directors of said corporation and that he signed his name thereto by like order.	of Chila M. Husch My commission expires June 27, 2020 Notary Public
CERTIFICATE	
I, Brian W, Bolash, Secretary of ERIE INSURANCE COMPANY, do hereby certify that the original LIMITED POWER OF ATTORNEY, of which the foregoing is a full, true and correct copy, is still in full force and effect as of the date below.	ANCE TO RECORD CO.
In witness whereof, I have hereunto subscribed my name and affixed corporate Scal of the Company by facishniles pursuant to the action of the Board of Directors of the Company.	Brian W. Bolash, Secretary

this 5TH

day of APRIL 2019

SF57 9/16